From: kevdeo®@live.com

To: aidenfett@verizon.net

Subject: Settling Damaged 1:1 T-600 Statue (Greedowan / Ebay arts)
Date: Wed, 9 Sept 2015

Good Morning Aiden,
I hope the west coast is treating you well.

Given that this transaction has been going on for almost 4 months, the
least you could do is return my calls, voicemails, or text

messages. Not communicating is even worse that telling me you need
more time.

I'm looking forward to hearing from you by the end of this week. I'm
currently reaching out to the forum mods to lay some ground work.
Like I said, they seem to think I'm more than justified. Especially given
the paper trail I have on this whole thing.

Talk soon,

KEVIN DEOLIVEIRA




From: kevdeo@live.com

To: aidenfett@verizon.net

Subject: Settling Damaged 1:1 T-600 Statue (Greedowan / Ebay arts)
Date: Tue, 4 Aug 2015 11:52:14 -0400

Good morning Aiden,

I hope things on the west coast are going well. I'm writing you
this email to follow up on our discussion via text last weekend. As
you know, we're approaching the 3 week agreement we made for
the $300 partial refund on the damaged t-600 statue. We agreed
to this on 7/15 (via phone) and you emailed it in writing on

7/17 (see email chain below).

I've done my best to be flexible and accommodating from

the beginning of this transaction, which was 2 months ago
(6/4/15). You and I both know this transaction has been a mess:
The initial shipping delays, 2 price increases (shipping materials
then additional shipping), the damage to the statue, and finally
the insurance fiasco with UPS because they did not approve of
the packing. Regardless of where we point the finger, it hasn't
been a good experience for me.

I hate having to write this email. It's a terrible position to be in,
and I'm hoping we can avoid this outcome entirely. But, it's only
fair to make you aware of where I'm at.

Have a good day. I'm confident we can still settle this,

KEVIN DEOLIVEIRA




From: kevdeo®@live.com

To: aidenfett@verizon.net

Subject: RE: Partial refund

Date: Fri, 17 Jul 2015 11:43:16 -0400

Awesome, thank you.

KEVIN DEOLIVEIRA

> Subject: Partial refund

> From: aidenfett@verizon.net

> Date: Fri, 17 Jul 2015 08:41:33 -0700

> To: kevdeo@live.com

>

> | agree to partially refund $300.00

> To Kevin DeOliveira over the span of 3 weeks.

> Payments to be made via PayPal and in amounts totaling $300.00
>



Hi there,

Just looking for that tracking! How'd it go with UPS?

KEVIN DEOLIVEIRA

Re: You've received an invoice (1:1 T-600 7' statue)
from Ebay arts

> From: kevdeo@live.com

> Date: Fri, 25 June 2015 08:41:33 -0700

> To: aidenfett@verizon.net

Hi Aiden,

Please keep me in the loop (via email) as the UPS claim progresses.
Do you have a claim number yet?

Kevin DeOliveira

Director / Editor

FACTION

440.465.3701



kevdeo.com

Subject: Re: 1:1 T-600 7' statue from Ebay arts
From: aidenfett@verizon.net

Date: Mon, 15 Jun 2015 22:20:36 -0700

To: kevdeo@live.com

No worries. I'm a fellow collector so | know how it goes.
This thing is BIG! You'll love it!
What are you doing up??? Aren't you 3 hours ahead??

On Jun 15, 2015, at 10:18 PM, Kevin DeOliveira <kevdeo@live.com> wrote:

Thank god. We're all good.
Thanks dude, looking forward to it.

Kevin DeOliveira


http://kevdeo.com/
mailto:kevdeo@live.com

Sent from my iPhone.

On Jun 16, 2015, at 1:15 AM, aiden <aidenfett@verizon.net> wrote:

Lol. Don't worry | used two full huge bags of peanuts.

It's packed perfectly and | used 200Ibs per square in.

Boxes which ups requires.

I'm shipping via my ups store and they always confirm what | ship prior to
closing the boxes. Since they ship it. They basically confirm how it was
packed.

Ups ask them if their is a claim and they either verify or dispute the way it
was packed.

They throw on all of the fragile stickers and all of the do no stack stickers ...
Which is awesome of them.

And honestly... This thing is a freaking tank!!!

Nothing will break it! It's a Terminator!! Lol

On Jun 15, 2015, at 9:58 PM, Kevin DeOliveira <kevdeo@Ilive.com> wrote:

Please don't hate me for what I'm about to say. | have to send this
message to protect myself, given the amount of money in play.

Way more packing material went into those boxes than shown in the
photos right? Gaps of air = crushed statue. If those parts have packing gaps
inside the boxes they'll get destroyed. Can we at least fill the void with
peanuts? Those are usually a cheap alternative in this type of case.

I believe UPS requires a snug fit 2-3" of padding between the item and box


mailto:aidenfett@verizon.net
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(all the way around!) to even honor an insurance claim.

If you filled them up right after taking the photos, then ignore what I'm
saying. | just can't give affirmation to what I'm seeing. It's stressing me out
big time.

My confirmed shipping address is below:

Kevin DeOliveira

On Jun 4, 2015, at 10:39 PM, Ebay arts via PayPal <member@paypal.com>
wrote:

Subject: Re: 1:1 T-600 7' statue from Ebay arts
From: aidenfett@verizon.net

Date: Mon, 15 Jun 2015 22:20:36 -0700

To: kevdeo@live.com

No worries. I'm a fellow collector so | know how it goes.

This thing is BIG! You'll love it!
What are you doing up??? Aren't you 3 hours ahead??

On Jun 15, 2015, at 10:18 PM, Kevin DeOliveira <kevdeo@live.com> wrote:

Thank god. We're all good.
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Thanks dude, looking forward to it.

Kevin DeOliveira
Sent from my iPhone.

On Jun 16, 2015, at 1:15 AM, aiden <aidenfett@verizon.net> wrote:

Lol. Don't worry | used two full huge bags of peanuts.

It's packed perfectly and | used 200lbs per square in.

Boxes which ups requires.

I'm shipping via my ups store and they always confirm what | ship prior to
closing the boxes. Since they ship it. They basically confirm how it was
packed.

Ups ask them if their is a claim and they either verify or dispute the way it
was packed.

They throw on all of the fragile stickers and all of the do no stack stickers ...
Which is awesome of them.

And honestly... This thing is a freaking tank!!!

Nothing will break it! It's a Terminator!! Lol

On Jun 16, 2015, at 12:08 AM, aiden <aidenfett@verizon.net> wrote:

Pix.

All dropped off tomorrow.

Please send me your shipping addy | know it's in PayPal.
But just to confirm.

Thanks!!<image8.PNG>.<image6.PNG><image5.PNG>.<image3.PNG>
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On Jun 15, 2015, at 3:28 PM, Kevin DeOliveira <kevdeo@live.com> wrote:

Signature would be great. Thanks!

KEVIN DEOLIVEIRA

Subject: Re: 1:1 T-600 7' statue from Ebay arts
From: aidenfett@verizon.net

Date: Mon, 15 Jun 2015 15:18:19 -0700

To: kevdeo@live.com

Sorry Kevin! | appreciate the sale and

Your business. It's just that this isn't a $350.00 sale. It makes n nervous and |
want everything to be on spot.

If you'd like I'll ask for signature confirmation ?

That way you'll have to be around for delivery.

On Jun 15, 2015, at 3:00 PM, Kevin DeOliveira <kevdeo@live.com> wrote:
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Hi there,

Don't get me wrong, it needs to be packed safely. However this delay
is causing some unwanted trouble on my end as I'm going out of town
for work in about a week. I'll make plans for someone to receive it if
I'm gone by the time it's set to arrive.

And listen, 5 days won't kill anyone. It's just not what we agreed to,
and this is a transaction.

I'm sure it will be smooth sailing from here. Let's do this. Thanks for
keeping him safe and I hope your move went well!

KEVIN DEOLIVEIRA

Subject: Re: 1:1 T-600 7' statue from Ebay arts
From: aidenfett@verizon.net

Date: Mon, 15 Jun 2015 12:18:57 -0700

To: kevdeo@live.com

Kevin,
Finishing up getting this mister packed.
I'm sure you won't mind a slight delay.
I'm making sure | pack this beast properly.
I'll have it all wrapped up this evening. Photos included
And dropping it off at ups tomorrow afternoon insured.
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Thank you

On Jun 14, 2015, at 7:41 AM, Kevin DeOliveira <kevdeo@live.com> wrote:

Hi Aiden,

Just following up today to get the T-600's UPS tracking info from you.
I need to plan accordingly so someone is around when this thing
arrives.

I'd also like to get my hands on the packing photos when you get a

moment.

Let's talk soon,

KEVIN DEOLIVEIRA

Subject: Re: 1:1 T-600 7' statue from Ebay arts
From: aidenfett@verizon.net

Date: Thu, 11 Jun 2015 08:10:13 -0700

To: kevdeo@live.com

Kevin,
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Good morning. Yes, | have all of the boxes and packing popcorn.
I'm purchasing the bubble wrap today.
I'll take pictures of the packing process as requested.
| will be dropping the boxes off at the ups store this Saturday.
Please do not hesitate to contact me with any questions or other request for
packing.
-thanks

OnJun 11, 2015, at 6:39 AM, Kevin DeOliveira <kevdeo@live.com> wrote:

Hi Aiden,

Kevin DeOliveira
Sent from my iPhone.

OnJun 4, 2015, at 11:21 PM, aiden <aidenfett@verizon.net> wrote:

Received payment sir.

Thank you so much... I'll get the boxes and packing materials ready this
week and will have it out a wee from today.

Thank you.
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On Jun 4, 2015, at 7:59 PM, Kevin DeOliveira <kevdeo@Iive.com> wrote:

Running a quick errand. I'll shoot you a payment shortly.

Kevin DeOliveira
Sent from my iPhone.

INVOICE

On Jun 4, 2015, at 10:39 PM, Ebay arts via PayPal <member@paypal.com>
wrote:
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